CALENDAR FOR THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS

CONTRA COSTA COUNTY

AND FOR SPECIAL DISTRICTS, AGENCIES, AND AUTHORITIES GOVERNED BY THE BOARD

BOARD CHAMBERS ROOM 107, ADMINISTRATION BUILDING, 651 PINE STREET
MARTINEZ, CALIFORNIA 94553-1229

CANDACE ANDERSEN, CHAIR, 2ND DISTRICT
MARY N. PIEPHO, VICE CHAIR, 3RD DISTRICT
JOHN GIOIA, 1ST DISTRICT

KAREN MITCHOFF, 4TH DISTRICT
FEDERAL D. GLOVER, 5TH DISTRICT

DAVID J. TWA, CLERK OF THE BOARD AND COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR, (925) 335-1900

PERSONS WHO WISH TO ADDRESS THE BOARD DURING PUBLIC COMMENT OR WITH RESPECT TO
AN ITEM THAT IS ON THE AGENDA, WILL BE LIMITED TO TWO (2) MINUTES.

The Board Chair may reduce the amount of time allotted per speaker at the beginning of each item or public comment period depending on the number of speakers and the business of
the day. Your patience is appreciated.

PURSUANT TO THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS RULES OF PROCEDURES (RULE 14), IF ANY
MEETING IS WILLFULLY INTERRUPTED BY A GROUP OR GROUPS OF PERSONS SO THAT THE
ORDERLY CONDUCT OF THE MEETING BECOMES INFEASIBLE AND ORDER CANNOT BE
RESTORED BY THE REMOVAL OF INDIVIDUALS WHO ARE WILLFULLY INTERRUPTING THE
MEETING, THE CHAIR MAY ORDER THE MEETING ROOM CLEARED, AS AUTHORIZED BY LAW

(GOV. CODE, § 54957.9), RECESS THE MEETING, OR ADJOURN THE MEETING.

A lunch break or closed session may be called at the discretion of the Board Chair.

Staff reports related to open session items on the agenda are also accessible on line at www.co.contra-costa.ca.us.

AGENDA
November 15, 2016

9:00 A.M. Convene and announce adjournment to closed session in Room 101.

Closed Session
A. CONFERENCE WITH LABOR NEGOTIATORS

1. Agency Negotiators: David Twa and Bruce Heid.

Employee Organizations: Contra Costa County Employees’ Assn., Local No. 1; Am. Fed., State,
County, & Mun. Empl., Locals 512 and 2700; Calif. Nurses Assn.; Service Empl. Int’l Union,
Local 1021; District Attorney’s Investigators Assn.; Deputy Sheriffs Assn.; United Prof.
Firefighters, Local 1230; Physicians’ & Dentists’ Org. of Contra Costa; Western Council of
Engineers; United Chief Officers Assn.; Service Employees International Union Local 2015;
Contra Costa County Defenders Assn.; Probation Peace Officers Assn. of Contra Costa County;
Contra Costa County Deputy District Attorneys’ Assn.; and Prof. & Tech. Engineers, Local 21,
AFL-CIO; Teamsters Local 856.

2. Agency Negotiators: David Twa.

Unrepresented Employees: All unrepresented employees.



http://www.co.contra-costa.ca.us

B. CONFERENCE WITH LEGAL COUNSEL--EXISTING LITIGATION (Gov. Code, §
54956.9(d)(1))

1. Contra Costa County v. Peter J. Dailey, et al.,
Contra Costa County Superior Court Case No. C14-01154

2. Contra Costa County v. Frederick R. Schiff, et al.,
Contra Costa County Superior Court Case No. C14-01155

3. Contra Costa County v. Harry H. Williamson, Sr., et al.,
Contra Costa County Superior Court Case No. C14-01156

4. In re: West Contra Costa Healthcare District, Debtor, United States Bankruptcy Court,
Northern District of California, Case No. 16-42917

5. Randy David Ray Robertson v. Contra Costa County, et al., United States District Court,
Northern District of California, Case No. 15-cv-02549

6. Lawrence Nunes v. Contra Costa County Fire Protection District,
Contra Costa County Superior Court Case No. C13-01475

9:30 A.M. Call to order and opening ceremonies.

Inspirational Thought- "The greatest part of our happiness depends on our dispositions, not our
circumstances." ~ Martha Washington

CONSIDER CONSENT ITEMS (Items listed as C.1 through C.73 on the following agenda) —
Items are subject to removal from Consent Calendar by request of any Supervisor or on request
for discussion by a member of the public. Items removed from the Consent Calendar will be
considered with the Discussion Items.

PRESENTATIONS (5 Minutes Each)

PR.1 PRESENTATION launching the 2016 "Contra Costa County Cares" Holiday
Food Fight. (Larry Sly, Executive Director, Food Bank, Kate Sibley, Executive
Assistant, LAFCO)

PR.2 PRESENTATION recognizing Helen Benjamin upon her retirement as Chancellor
of the Contra Costa Community College District. (Supervisor Andersen)

PR.3 PRESENTATION recognizing Carla Young Garrett, President of the Center for
Economic and Civic Education. (Supervisor Andersen)

PR.4 PRESENTATION recognizing November 17, 2016 as World Pancreatic Cancer
Day in Contra Costa County. (Supervisor Andersen)



DISCUSSION ITEMS

D. 1 CONSIDER Consent Items previously removed.

D.2

D.3

D. 6

HEARING to consider adopting Ordinance No. 2016-22, adopting the 2016
California Building, Residential, California Green Building Standards, Electrical,
Plumbing, Mechanical, and Existing Building Codes, with changes, additions, and
deletions. (Jason Crapo, Conservation and Development Department)

CONSIDER adopting a position on two identical bills, Senate Bill X 1-1 (Beall)
and Assembly Bill X 1-26 (Frazier), which will increase revenues for
transportation infrastructure purposes through tax and fee increases, streamline
project delivery through environmental review revisions, and other transportation
revenue protective actions, as recommended by the Transportation, Water, &
Infrastructure Committee. (John Cunningham, Conservation and Development
Department)

HEARING on appeals of the County Planning Commission decision to approve a
land use permit for the Diablo MX Ranch Motocross Park project on Camino
Diablo Road near Brentwood, and to consider related actions under the California
Environmental Quality Act. (Law Offices of David W. Trotter, Appellant; John
and Lori Ramirez, Applicants; James and Dorothy Schmidt, Owners) (Lashun
Cross and Gary Kupp, Department of Conservation and Development)

CONSIDER accepting report from Health Service Department and providing
direction on the LAFCO Special Study of Governance Options for the West
Contra Costa Healthcare District. (William Walker, M.D., Health Services
Director)

CONSIDER making appointments to the West Contra Costa Healthcare District
Board of Directors, pursuant to Elections Code section 10515. (David Twa,
County Administrator)

CONSIDER creating a Sustainability Commission to advise the Board on issues
related to the County’s Climate Action Plan and opportunities to realize equity and
fairness across the diverse communities of Contra Costa County in sustainability
programs that support the Climate Action Plan, and provide suggestions to staff
and the Board on how to better engage Contra Costa County residents on
sustainability issues and implementation of the Climate Action Plan, as
recommended by the Ad Hoc Sustainability Committee. (John Kopchik, Director
of Conservation and Development)



D. 8

CONSIDER adopting Resolution No. 2016/643 approving the Side Letter between
Contra Costa County and the Physicians’ and Dentists’ Organization of Contra
Costa (PDOCC) modifying the Preamble and Section 35.4 Duration of Agreement
of the memorandum of understanding to extend the contract from October 31,
2016 through February 28, 2017. (David Twa, County Administrator)

D. 9 PUBLIC COMMENT (2 Minutes/Speaker)

D. 10 CONSIDER reports of Board members.

Closed Session

ADJOURN

CONSENT ITEMS

Road and Transportation

C.1

APPROVE and AUTHORIZE the Chair, Board of Supervisors, to execute, on
behalf of Contra Costa County (County), agreements with Contra Costa
Transportation Authority authorizing the County to provide right of way and
eminent domain services for the I-680 North Express Lanes Project, effective
April 1, 2016, and take related actions under the California Environmental Quality
Act, as recommended by the Public Works Director, [-680 Corridor area. (100%
CCTA funds)

Engineering Services

C.2

C.3

C.4

ADOPT Resolution No. 2016/599 accepting completion of improvements for road
acceptance RA12-01250, for a project developed by Shapell Homes, a Division of
Shapell Industries, Inc., a Delaware Corporation, as recommended by the Public
Works Director, San Ramon (Dougherty Valley) area. (100% Developers Fees)

ADOPT Resolution No. 2016/620 approving the fourth extension of the
Subdivision Agreement for subdivision SD06-08993, for a project being
developed by Hofmann Land Development Company, as recommended by the
Public Works Director, Discovery Bay area. (No fiscal impact)

ADOPT Resolution No. 2016/622 approving the fifth extension of the Subdivision
Agreement for subdivision SD05-08992, for a project being developed by
Hofmann Land Development Company, as recommended by the Public Works
Director, Discovery Bay area. (No fiscal impact)



C.5

C.6

C.8

ADOPT Resolution No. 2016/624 accepting completion of private improvements
for subdivision SD05-08992, for a project developed by Hofmann Land
Development Company, as recommended by the Public Works Director,
Discovery Bay area. (100% Developer Fees)

ADOPT Resolution No. 2016/625 approving the sixth extension of the
Subdivision Agreement for subdivision SD06-09067, for a project being
developed by Hofmann Land Development Company, as recommended by the
Public Works Director, Discovery Bay area. (No fiscal impact)

ADOPT Resolution No. 2016/626 accepting completion of private improvements
for subdivision SD06-09067, for a project developed by Hofmann Land
Development Company, as recommended by the Public Works Director,
Discovery Bay area. (100% Developer Fees)

ADOPT Resolution No. 2016/634 ratifying the prior decision of the Public Works
Director, or designee, to fully close a portion of Pomona Street between
Alexander Avenue and Rolph Park Avenue, on November 11, 2016 from 9:00
a.m. through 12:00 p.m., for the purpose of John Swett Band Boosters Veterans
Day parade, Crockett area. (No fiscal impact)

Special Districts & County Airports

C.9

APPROVE and AUTHORIZE the Director of Airports, or designee, to execute a
month-to-month hangar rental agreement with Charles Luther for a T-hangar at

Buchanan Field Airport effective November 8, 2016 in the monthly amount of
$394.10. (100% Airport Enterprise Fund)

Geologic Hazard Abatement Districts

C.10

ADOPT Resolution No. 2016/03 declaring the GHAD's intent to order the
assessment set forth in the attached Engineers Report and set a public hearing for
January 17, 2017, to consider the proposed assessment and any objections thereto.

Claims, Collections & Litigation

C.11

C.12

DENY claims filed by Alano Anderson, Jessy DeLima, Christina Fasse,
Dominique MclInnis, Bryan Smith, The Estate of Norma Supapo (Deceased).
DENY late claim filed by Michael Geary Wilson.

RECEIVE public report of litigation settlement agreements that became final
during the period of October 1, 2016, through October 31, 2016.



Statutory Actions

C.13

ACCEPT Board members' meeting reports for October 2016.

Honors & Proclamations

C.14

ADOPT Resolution No. 2016/644 recognizing Helen Benjamin upon her
retirement as Chancellor of the Contra Costa Community College District, as
recommended by Supervisor Andersen.

ADOPT Resolution No 2016/552 recognizing Michael McDonald of the Alamo
Municipal Advisory Council for his dedication, hard work and loyalty to Alamo
and its residents, as recommended by Supervisor Andersen.

ADOPT Resolution No. 2016/553 recognizing Ed Best of the Alamo Municipal
Advisory Council for his dedication, hard work, and loyalty to Alamo and its
residents, as recommended by Supervisor Andersen.

ADOPT Resolution No. 2016/608 recognizing November 17, 2016 as "World
Pancreatic Cancer Day" in Contra Costa County, as recommended by Supervisor
Andersen.

ADOPT Resolution No. 2016/609 recognizing Fred Weil of the Moraga Orinda
Fire District Board for his continued support to the community of Moraga and
Contra Costa County, as recommended by Supervisor Andersen.

ADOPT Resolution No. 2016/611 recognizing Alex Evans of the Moraga Orinda
Fire District's Division Five for his dedication to his community and it's residents,
as recommended by Supervisor Andersen.

ADOPT Resolution No. 2016/629 recognizing the contributions of Linda Weder
on her 25 years of service to Contra Costa County, as recommended by the Public
Works Director. (No fiscal impact)

ADOPT Resolution No. 2016/637 recognizing the contributions of Roland
Hindsman, on the occasion of his retirement from Contra Costa County, as
recommended by the Public Works Director. (No fiscal impact)

ADOPT Resolution No. 2016/646 launching the 2016 "Contra Costa County
Cares" Holiday Food Fight, as recommended by the County Administrator.



C.23

ADOPT Resolution No. 2016/650 recognizing Carla Young Garrett, President of
the Center for Economic and Civic Education, as recommended by Supervisor
Andersen.

Appointments & Resignations

C.24

APPOINT five individuals and REAPPOINT thirteen individuals to seats on the
Emergency Medical Care Committee for terms expiring September 30, 2018, as
recommended by the Health Services Director.

Appropriation Adjustments

C.25

Employment and Human Services (0501)/ Fleet ISF (0064): APPROVE

Appropriation and Revenue Adjustment No. 5023 authorizing the transfer of
appropriations in the amount of $31,187 from Employment and Human Services
Department to the Fleet Internal Service Fund for the purchase of one replacement
vehicle. (100% County)

Health Services (0467)/Fleet ISF (0064): APPROVE Appropriation and Revenue

Adjustment No. 5025 authorizing the transfer of appropriations in the amount of
$27,387 from Health Services Behavioral Health Division to the Fleet Internal
Service Fund for the purchase of one vehicle for the implementation of the
Partners in Aging project. (100% MHSA)

2011 Local Revenue Fund (115300): APPROVE Appropriations and Revenue

Adjustment No. 5026 increasing expenditure appropriations and estimated revenue
by $2,215,167 from the State of California related to continued implementation of
AB109 Public Safety Realignment for fiscal year 2016/17. (100% State AB 109
Public Safety Realignment revenue)

Employment and Human Services (0504/0503): APPROVE Appropriation and

Revenue Adjustment No. 5024 authorizing an adjustment to the Federal, State and
County expenditure and revenue budgets based on revised caseload projections for
CalWORKS (0504) and General Assistance (0503).

CSA P-6 Zone Funding (7629)/Sheriff's Office (0255): APPROVE Appropriations

and Revenue Adjustment No. 5020 authorizing new revenue in the amount of
$126,941 from CSA P-6 Zone funding and appropriating it in the Sheriff's Office
(0255) to add one Sheriff's Community Service Officer position to the Field
Operations Bureau - Discovery Bay community. (100% CSA P-6 Zone funds)
(Consider with C.34)

Intergovernmental Relations




C. 30

AUTHORIZE the Conservation and Development Director, or designee, to apply
for membership and pay associated annual membership dues totaling $2,900 to the
Local Government Sustainable Energy Coalition and the Urban Sustainability
Directors Network, as recommended by the Ad Hoc Sustainability Committee.
(100% County General Fund)

Personnel Actions

C.31

C. 32

C.33

C. 34

C.35

C. 36

C.37

ADOPT Position Adjustment Resolution No. 21913 to establish the classification
of Animal Center Operations Manager (represented) and add one (1) position, and
cancel one (1) vacant Animal Center Technician (represented) position in the
Animal Services Department. (32% User fees, 31% City revenues, 37% County)

ADOPT Position Adjustment Resolution No. 21976 to reclassify one Clerk-Senior
Level (represented) position and it's incumbent to Secretary-Advanced Level
(represented) position and cancel one Clerk-Beginning Level (represented)
position in the Sheriff's Office - Custody Services Bureau. (Cost savings)

ADOPT Position Adjustment Resolution No. 21949 to reclassify Accountant II1
(represented) position and its incumbent to Supervising Accountant (represented)
position in the Office of the Sheriff- Fiscal Unit. (100% General Fund)

ADOPT Position Adjustment Resolution No. 21993 to add one Sheriff's
Community Service Officer (represented) position in the Sheriff's Office - Patrol
Division for the Discovery Bay community. (100% CSA P-6 Zone funds)
(Consider with C.29)

ADOPT Position Adjustment Resolution No. 21994 to add twenty-three (23)
represented positions in the Health Services Department. (100% Third party
revenues)

ADOPT Position Adjustment Resolution No. 21995 to add ninety-eight (98)
represented positions in the Health Services Department. (100% Whole Person
Care Pilot Program funds)

ADOPT Position Adjustment Resolution No. 21981 to establish the classification
of Quality Assurance Monitor (represented) and add one position, and cancel one
vacant Clerk-Experienced Level (represented) position in the Employment and
Human Services Department. (76% Federal, 14% State, 10% County)

Grants & Contracts

APPROVE and AUTHORIZE execution of agreements between the County and the
following agencies for receipt of fund and/or services:



.38

.39

.40

.41

.42

.43

.44

ADOPT Resolution No. 2016/632 to approve and authorize the Employment and
Human Services Director, or designee, to execute a contract amendment with
California Department of Aging to increase the payment limit by $34,789 to a new
payment limit of $60,945 for Medicare Improvements for Patients and Providers
Act services with no change in the term September 30, 2015 through September
29,2017. (No County match)

APPROVE and AUTHORIZE the County Librarian, or designee, to apply for and
accept a grant in the amount of $5,000 from The San Pablo Koshland Civic Unity
Fellows to provide materials and services to the San Pablo Library for the period
January 1 through December 31, 2017. (No Library Fund match)

APPROVE and AUTHORIZE the Conservation and Development Director, or
designee, to execute a contract with the Energy Council, a joint powers agency, to
accept funding in an amount not to exceed $45,000 to assist Pacific Gas and
Electric Company with its East Bay Energy Watch Local Government Partnership
Program for the period May 10 through December 31, 2016. (100% Energy Watch
funds)

APPROVE and AUTHORIZE the Health Services Director, or designee, to
execute a grant award with the California Department of Public Health, to pay
County an amount not to exceed $106,843, for the Core Sexually Transmitted
Disease Management Project, for the period July 1, 2016 through June 30, 2019.
(No County match)

APPROVE and AUTHORIZE the Director of Child Support Services, or
designee, to execute a contract with Merced County, to pay this County an amount
not to exceed $120,000 for early intervention services to prevent child support
payment delinquency for the period October 1, 2016 through September 30, 2017.
(No County match)

ADOPT Resolution No. 2016/649 authorizing the Sheriff-Coroner, or designee to
apply for and accept State Homeland Security Grant Program (SHSGP) funds in
an initial amount of $1,200,036 from the California Governor’s Office of
Emergency Services, make required grant assurances and authorize specified
Sheriff’s Office officials to act on behalf of the County to obtain funding for the
period of September 1, 2016 through the end of grant fund availability. (100%
Federal)

Acting as the Governing Board of the Contra Costa County Fire Protection
District, APPROVE and AUTHORIZE the Fire Chief, or designee, to apply for
and accept grant funding from the U.S. Department of Homeland Security, Federal
Emergency Management Agency, Assistance to Firefighters Grant Program in an
amount not to exceed $350,000 for the purchase and installation of a Phase 5 live
fire training unit. (90% Federal, 10% District match)



APPROVE and AUTHORIZE execution of agreement between the County and the
following parties as noted for the purchase of equipment and/or services:

C.45

C. 46

C.47

C. 48

C.49

APPROVE and AUTHORIZE the Public Works Director, or designee, to execute
a contract amendment with Francisco & Associates, Inc., to extend the term from
December 31, 2016 to December 31, 2017 and increase the payment limit by
$25,000, to a new payment limit of $125,000, to continue providing pipeline
franchise administration services, Countywide. (100% Pipeline Franchise Fees)

APPROVE and AUTHORIZE the County Probation Officer, or designee, to
execute a contract amendment with the National Council on Crime and
Delinquency (NCCD) to extend the term from September 30, 2016 to March 31,
2017 with no change in the payment limit to provide evaluation and assessment of
the County's Smart Probation program. (100% Federal Funds)

APPROVE and AUTHORIZE the Purchasing Agent or designee to execute, on
behalf of the Chief Information Officer, a blanket purchase order with Graybar
Electric Company in an amount not to exceed $2,500,000 for the procurement of
radio, telecommunications equipment and parts, as needed, for the period
November 15, 2016 through December 31, 2017. (100% User fees)

APPROVE and AUTHORIZE the Employment and Human Services Director, or
designee, to execute a contract amendment with Planet Technologies, Inc.,
effective December 1, 2016, to increase the payment limit by $50,000 to a new
payment limit of $140,795 for additional professional information technology (IT)
services to upgrade and enhance the department's Intranet and Shared Text
Automated Retrieval System (STARS), and extend the term end date from June
30,2017 to December 31, 2017. (45% Federal, 45% State, 10% County)

APPROVE and AUTHORIZE the Health Services Director, or designee, to
execute a contract with Martha D. Newman, in an amount not to exceed $300,000,
to provide consultation and technical assistance to Contra Costa Regional Medical
and Health Centers Public Hospital Redesign and Incentives in Medi-Cal program,
for the period December 1, 2016 through November 30, 2017. (100% Hospital
Enterprise Fund I)

APPROVE and AUTHORIZE the Employment and Human Services Director, or
designee, to execute a contract amendment with Contra Costa Economic
Partnership Inc., effective October 31, 2016, to increase the payment limit by
$140,000 to a new payment limit of $225,000, to expand the scope of work and
continue promoting the East Bay Slingshot Initiative, and extend the term to April
1, 2016 through to June 30, 2017. (100% Federal)



.51

.52

.53

.54

.55

.56

.57

APPROVE and AUTHORIZE the Health Services Director, or designee, to
execute a contract with Alexander Gorodetsky, M.D., in an amount not to exceed
$116,480, to provide outpatient psychiatric services at the West County Adult
Mental Health Clinic, for the period January 1, 2017 through December 31, 2017.
(100% Mental Health Realignment)

APPROVE and AUTHORIZE the Health Services Director, or designee, to
execute a contract with Applied Remedial Services, Inc., in an amount not to
exceed $350,000, for removal and disposal of hazardous waste materials at Contra
Costa Regional Medical Center and Health Centers, for the period January 1, 2017
through December 31, 2017. (100% Hospital Enterprise Fund I)

APPROVE and AUTHORIZE the Health Services Director, or designee, to
execute a contract with Bay Area Executive Search, Inc., in an amount not to
exceed $170,000, to provide recruitment services for pharmacist candidates and
specialized registered nurses for the Safety and Performance Improvement
Department, for the period November 1, 2016 through October 31, 2017. (100%
Hospital Enterprise Fund I)

APPROVE and AUTHORIZE the Purchasing Agent, on behalf of the Health
Services Department, to execute a purchase order amendment with Food Service
Partners, Inc. to add $500,000 for a new total amount not to exceed $1,574,003 for
meals for patients and staff at the Contra Costa Regional Medical Center while the
cafeteria and kitchen are being renovated, with no change in the term from April

1, 2016 through December 31, 2016. (100% Hospital Enterprise Fund I)

APPROVE and AUTHORIZE the Health Services Director, or designee, to
execute a contract with Mental Health Management I, Inc. (dba Canyon Manor), in
an amount not to exceed $222,753, to provide mental health subacute care and
treatment services, for the period July 1, 2016 through June 30, 2017. (100%
Mental Health Realignment)

APPROVE and AUTHORIZE the Health Services Director, or designee, to
execute a contract with Sonja Robinson, R.N. (dba Healthcare Solutions USA), in
an amount not to exceed $384,000, to provide consultation on utilization review,
authorization and referral processes for Contra Costa Health Plan for the period
December 1, 2016 through November 30, 2017. (100% Contra Costa Health Plan
Enterprise Fund II)

ACKNOWLEDGE receipt of notice from Walnut Creek Surgical Associates, Inc.,
requesting termination of their contract for general surgery services and
APPROVE and AUTHORIZE the Health Services Director, or designee, to
terminate this contract effective close of business on October 31, 2016, as agreed
upon by both parties. (100% Contra Costa Health Plan Enterprise Fund II)



C. 60

C. 61

C. 62

APPROVE and AUTHORIZE the Health Services Director, or designee, to
execute a contract amendment with Diablo Valley Oncology and Hematology
Medical Group, effective January 1, 2017, to increase the payment limit by
$350,000 to a new payment limit of $2,350,000 to provide general surgery
services in addition to hematology/oncology and urology services, with no change
in the original term of August 1, 2016 through July 31, 2018. (100% Contra Costa
Health Plan Enterprise Fund II)

AUTHORIZE the Purchasing Agent, on behalf of the Health Services Department,
to 1) execute purchase orders for food to be provided at Program Governance
Meetings and 2) procure up to 200 $5 Safeway gift cards, with all expenses not to
exceed $4,190 to use as incentives for focus group program participants of the
Health Care for the Homeless Program, for the period November 1, 2016 through
October 31, 2017. (100% Human Resources and Services Administration Grant)

APPROVE and AUTHORIZE the Employment and Human Services Director, or
designee, to execute a contract amendment with Julia Dyckman Andrus Memorial,
Inc., effective October 30, 2016, to increase the payment limit by $37,290 for a
new payment limit of $170,460, and extend the term from October 31, 2016 to

December 31, 2016 for additional trauma awareness training services. (58% State,
42% Federal)

APPROVE and AUTHORIZE the Health Services Director, or designee, to
execute a contract amendment with Contra Costa ARC, effective November 1, 2016,
to increase the payment limit by $17,700 to a new payment limit of $197,700 to
provide additional units of mental health services to recipients of the CalWORKSs
program and their children, with no change in the original term of January 1, 2016
through December 31, 2016. (100% CalWORKs)

APPROVE and AUTHORIZE the Purchasing Agent to execute, on behalf of the
Sheriff-Coroner, a purchase order amendment with Good Source Solutions, Inc.,
to increase the payment limit by $150,000 to a new payment limit of $330,000 in
order to provide packed food meals for Martinez Detention Facility in addition to
supplying food products for the preparation of inmate meals at all three County
adult detention facilities for the period April 1, 2016 through March 31, 2017.
(100% General Fund)

Other Actions

C.63

C. 064

ACCEPT the Fiscal Year 2015/16 Park Impact and Park Dedication Fee Annual
Report, as recommended by the Conservation and Development Director.

APPROVE amended Conflict of Interest Code for the Moraga Elementary School
District, as recommended by the County Counsel.



C.65 APPROVE amended Conflict of Interest Code for the Lafayette School District, as
recommended by the County Counsel.

C.66 APPROVE amended Conflict of Interest Code for the Liberty Union High School
District, as recommended by the County Counsel.

C.67 APPROVE amended Conflict of Interest Code for the Contra Costa Transportation
Authority, as recommended by the County Counsel.

C.68 APPROVE amended Conflict of Interest Code for the Contra Costa County
Employees’ Retirement Association, as recommended by the County Counsel.

C.69 APPROVE the HVAC Upgrades Project at 40 Douglas Drive, Martinez, and
related actions under the California Environmental Quality Act, as recommended
by the Public Works Director. (100% General Fund)

C.70 APPROVE clarification of Board action of December 15, 2016 (Item C.61), which
approved and authorized the Health Services Director to execute a contract with
San Ramon Valley Fire Protection District for providing fire services based
education, training, patient safety and quality improvement services, to change the
term from December 15, 2015 through December 14, 2016, with no change in the
original amount not to exceed $125,000. (100% Measure H funds)

C.71 APPROVE clarification of Board action of December 15, 2015 (Item C.60), which
approved and authorized the Health Services Director to execute a contract with
San Ramon Valley Fire Protection District for providing electronic patient care
records hosting and support services, to change the term from December 15, 2015

to December 14, 2016, with no change in the original amount not to exceed
$100,900. (100% Measure H funds)

C.72 ABOLISH the Public and Environmental Health Advisory Board, as
recommended by the Internal Operations Committee.

C.73 CONTINUE the emergency action originally taken by the Board of Supervisors on
November 16, 1999, and most recently approved by the Board on November 8§,
2016, regarding the issue of homelessness in Contra Costa County, as
recommended by the Health Services Director. (No fiscal impact)

GENERAL INFORMATION

The Board meets in all its capacities pursuant to Ordinance Code Section 24-2.402, including as the
Housing Authority and the Successor Agency to the Redevelopment Agency. Persons who wish to
address the Board should complete the form provided for that purpose and furnish a copy of any
written statement to the Clerk.

Any disclosable public records related to an open session item on a regular meeting agenda and
distributed by the Clerk of the Board to a majority of the members of the Board of Supervisors less



than 96 hours prior to that meeting are available for public inspection at 651 Pine Street, First
Floor, Room 106, Martinez, CA 94553, during normal business hours.

All matters listed under CONSENT ITEMS are considered by the Board to be routine and will be
enacted by one motion. There will be no separate discussion of these items unless requested by a
member of the Board or a member of the public prior to the time the Board votes on the motion to
adopt.

Persons who wish to speak on matters set for PUBLIC HEARINGS will be heard when the Chair
calls for comments from those persons who are in support thereof or in opposition thereto. After
persons have spoken, the hearing is closed and the matter is subject to discussion and action by the
Board. Comments on matters listed on the agenda or otherwise within the purview of the Board of

Supervisors can be submitted to the office of the Clerk of the Board via mail: Board of
Supervisors, 651 Pine Street Room 106, Martinez, CA 94553; by fax: 925-335-1913.

The County will provide reasonable accommodations for persons with disabilities planning to
attend Board meetings who contact the Clerk of the Board at least 24 hours before the meeting, at
(925) 335-1900; TDD (925) 335-1915. An assistive listening device is available from the Clerk,
Room 106.

Copies of recordings of all or portions of a Board meeting may be purchased from the Clerk of the
Board. Please telephone the Office of the Clerk of the Board, (925) 335-1900, to make the
necessary arrangements.

Forms are available to anyone desiring to submit an inspirational thought nomination for inclusion
on the Board Agenda. Forms may be obtained at the Office of the County Administrator or Office
of the Clerk of the Board, 651 Pine Street, Martinez, California.

Subscribe to receive to the weekly Board Agenda by calling the Office of the Clerk of the Board,
(925) 335-1900 or using the County's on line subscription feature at the County’s Internet Web

Page, where agendas and supporting information may also be viewed:

WWW.CO.contra-costa.ca.us

STANDING COMMITTEES
The Ad Hoc on Sustainability Committee (Supervisors Federal D. Glover and John Gioia) TBD
The Airport Committee (Supervisors Mary N. Piepho and Karen Mitchoff) meets monthly on the
fourth Wednesday of the month at 1:30 p.m. at Director of Airports Office, 550 Sally Ride Drive,
Concord.
The Family and Human Services Committee (Supervisors Candace Andersen and Federal D.
Glover) meets on the second Monday of the month at 1:00 p.m. in Room 101, County
Administration Building, 651 Pine Street, Martinez.

The Finance Committee (Supervisors Federal D. Glover and Mary N. Piepho) meets on the


http://www.co.contra-costa.ca.us

second Thursday of the month at 10:30 a.m. in Room 101, County Administration Building, 651
Pine Street, Martinez.

The Hiring Outreach Oversight Committee (Supervisors Karen Mitchoff and John Gioia) meets
on the second Monday of every other month at 9:00 a.m. in Room 101, County Administration
Building, 651 Pine Street, Martinez.

The Internal Operations Committee (Supervisors John Gioia and Candace Andersen) meets on
the fourth Monday of the month at 11:00 a.m. in Room 101, County Administration Building, 651
Pine Street, Martinez.

The Legislation Committee (Supervisors Federal D. Glover and Karen Mitchoff) meets on the
second Monday of the month at 10:30 a.m. in Room 101, County Administration Building, 651
Pine Street, Martinez.

The Public Protection Committee (Supervisors Candace Andersen and John Gioia) meets on the
fourth Monday of the month at 9:00 a.m. in Room 101, County Administration Building, 651 Pine
Street, Martinez.

The Transportation, Water & Infrastructure Committee (Supervisors Mary N. Piepho and
Candace Andersen) meets on the second Thursday of the month at 1:00 p.m. in Room 101, County
Administration Building, 651 Pine Street, Martinez.

Ad Hoc on Sustainability TBD TBD See
Committee above

Airports Committee December 28, 2016 1:30 See
p.m. above

Family & Human Services December 12, 2016 1:00 See
Committee p.-m. above

Finance Committee Special Meeting November 1:00 See
15,2016 p.m. above

Hiring Outreach Oversight December 12, 2016 9:00 See
Committee a.m. above

Internal Operations Committee November 28, 2016 canceled [11:00 |See

Special Meeting December a.m. above
12,2016 RM. 107

Legislation Committee December 12, 2016 canceled ||1:30 See
Special Meeting December 8, |p.m. above
2016

Public Protection Committee November 28, 2016 Canceled [10:00 See
Special Meeting December a.m. above
12,2016

Transportation, Water & December 8, 2016 1:00 See

Infrastructure Committee p.m. above




AGENDA DEADLINE: Thursday, 12 noon, 12 days before the Tuesday Board meetings.

Glossary of Acronyms, Abbreviations, and other Terms (in alphabetical order):

Contra Costa County has a policy of making limited use of acronyms, abbreviations, and
industry-specific language in its Board of Supervisors meetings and written materials. Following is
a list of commonly used language that may appear in oral presentations and written materials
associated with Board meetings:

AB Assembly Bill

ABAG Association of Bay Area Governments

ACA Assembly Constitutional Amendment

ADA Americans with Disabilities Act of 1990

AFSCME American Federation of State County and Municipal Employees
AICP American Institute of Certified Planners

AIDS Acquired Immunodeficiency Deficiency Syndrome

ALUC Airport Land Use Commission

AOD Alcohol and Other Drugs

ARRA American Recovery & Reinvestment Act of 2009
BAAQMD Bay Area Air Quality Management District

BART Bay Area Rapid Transit District

BayRICS Bay Area Regional Interoperable Communications System
BCDC Bay Conservation & Development Commission

BGO Better Government Ordinance

BOS Board of Supervisors

CALTRANS California Department of Transportation

CalWIN California Works Information Network

CalWORKS California Work Opportunity and Responsibility to Kids
CAER Community Awareness Emergency Response

CAO County Administrative Officer or Office

CCCPFD (ConFire) Contra Costa County Fire Protection District
CCHP Contra Costa Health Plan

CCTA Contra Costa Transportation Authority

CCRMC Contra Costa Regional Medical Center

CCWD Contra Costa Water District

CDBG Community Development Block Grant

CFDA Catalog of Federal Domestic Assistance

CEQA California Environmental Quality Act

CIO Chief Information Officer

COLA Cost of living adjustment

ConFire (CCCFPD) Contra Costa County Fire Protection District
CPA Certified Public Accountant

CPI Consumer Price Index

CSA County Service Area

CSAC California State Association of Counties

CTC California Transportation Commission



dba doing business as

DSRIP Delivery System Reform Incentive Program

EBMUD East Bay Municipal Utility District

ECCFPD East Contra Costa Fire Protection District

EIR Environmental Impact Report

EIS Environmental Impact Statement

EMCC Emergency Medical Care Committee

EMS Emergency Medical Services

EPSDT Early State Periodic Screening, Diagnosis and Treatment Program (Mental Health)
et al. et alii (and others)

FAA Federal Aviation Administration

FEMA Federal Emergency Management Agency

F&HS Family and Human Services Committee

First 5 First Five Children and Families Commission (Proposition 10)
FTE Full Time Equivalent

FY Fiscal Year

GHAD Geologic Hazard Abatement District

GIS Geographic Information System

HCD (State Dept of) Housing & Community Development

HHS (State Dept of ) Health and Human Services

HIPAA Health Insurance Portability and Accountability Act
HIV Human Immunodeficiency Virus

HOME Federal block grant to State and local governments designed exclusively to create
affordable housing for low-income households

HOPWA Housing Opportunities for Persons with AIDS Program
HOYV High Occupancy Vehicle

HR Human Resources

HUD United States Department of Housing and Urban Development
ITHSS In-Home Supportive Services

Inc. Incorporated

IOC Internal Operations Committee

ISO Industrial Safety Ordinance

JPA Joint (exercise of) Powers Authority or Agreement
Lamorinda Lafayette-Moraga-Orinda Area

LAFCo Local Agency Formation Commission

LLC Limited Liability Company

LLP Limited Liability Partnership

Local 1 Public Employees Union Local 1

LVN Licensed Vocational Nurse

MAC Municipal Advisory Council

MBE Minority Business Enterprise

M.D. Medical Doctor

M.F.T. Marriage and Family Therapist

MIS Management Information System

MOE Maintenance of Effort

MOU Memorandum of Understanding

MTC Metropolitan Transportation Commission

NACo National Association of Counties



NEPA National Environmental Policy Act

OB-GYN Obstetrics and Gynecology

O.D. Doctor of Optometry

OES-EOC Office of Emergency Services-Emergency Operations Center
OPEB Other Post Employment Benefits

OSHA Occupational Safety and Health Administration

PARS Public Agencies Retirement Services

PEPRA Public Employees Pension Reform Act

Psy.D. Doctor of Psychology

RDA Redevelopment Agency

RFI Request For Information

RFP Request For Proposal

RFQ Request For Qualifications

RN Registered Nurse

SB Senate Bill

SBE Small Business Enterprise

SEIU Service Employees International Union

SUASI Super Urban Area Security Initiative

SWAT Southwest Area Transportation Committee

TRANSPAC Transportation Partnership & Cooperation (Central)
TRANSPLAN Transportation Planning Committee (East County)
TRE or TTE Trustee

TWIC Transportation, Water and Infrastructure Committee
UASI Urban Area Security Initiative

VA Department of Veterans Affairs

vs. versus (against)

WAN Wide Area Network

WBE Women Business Enterprise

WCCTAC West Contra Costa Transportation Advisory Committee



Contra
To:  Board of Supervisors Costa
From: Jason Crapo, County Building Official Cou nty

Date: November 15,2016

Subject: Hearing to Consider Adopting Ordinance No. 2016-22, Adopting the 2016 California Building Stanadards Code, as
Modified

RECOMMENDATION(S):

1. OPEN the public hearing on Ordinance No. 2016-22, RECEIVE testimony, and CLOSE the public hearing.

2. ADOPT Ordinance No. 2016-22, adopting the 2016 California Building Standard Codes, the 2016 California
Residential Code, the 2016 California Green Building Standards Code, the 2016 California Electrical Code, the 2016
California Plumbing Code, the 2016 California Mechanical Code and the 2016 Existing Building Codes, with
changes, additions and deletions.

3. ADOPT the attached findings in support of the County's changes, additions and deletions to the statewide codes.

4. DIRECT the publication of ordinance summary prepared by County Counsel and DIRECT the Clerk of the Board
of Supervisors to publish a certified copy of the full text of the adopted ordinance in the office of the Clerk of the
Board, in accordance with Government Code section 25124 (b).

5. DIRECT the Department of Conservation and Development, pursuant to Health and Safety Code section 17958.7,
to send a certified copy of Ordinance No. 2016-22, the attached findings, and the Board Order to the California
Department of Housing and Community Development and to the California Building

APPROVE | | oTHER

|:| RECOMMENDATION OF BOARD
COMMITTEE

RECOMMENDATION OF CNTY ADMINISTRATOR

Action of Board On: 11/15/2016 |:| APPROVED AS RECOMMENDED |:| OTHER

Clerks Notes:

VOTE OF SUPERVISORS

I hereby certify that this is a true and correct copy of an action taken and entered on the minutes of the Board
of Supervisors on the date shown.

ATTESTED: November 15,2016

Contact: Jason Crapo, , County Administrator and Clerk of the Board of Supervisors
925-674-7722

By:, Deputy

cc:



RECOMMENDATION(S): (CONT'D)

Standards Commission.
6. FIND that adoption of ordinance is exempt from CEQA pursuant to CEQA Guidelines section 15061 (b)(3).

7. DIRECT staff to file a Notice of Exemption with the County Clerk.

FISCAL IMPACT:
None.

BACKGROUND:

The California Building Standards Commission has adopted the 2016 California Building Standards Code
(CBSC), replacing the 2013 CBSC. The CBSC includes the California Building, Residential, Electrical,
Plumbing, Mechanical, Green Building Standards, and Existing Building Codes. These statewide codes are
effective January 1, 2017. The Department of Conservation and Development is responsible for enforcing the
CBSC within the unincorporated area of Contra Costa County.

The 2016 CBSC represents the new minimum required standards for new building construction in California.
Health and Safety Code sections 17958.5 and 18941.5 authorizes a local jurisdiction to modify or change these
codes and establish more restrictive building standards if the local jurisdiction finds that the changes and
modifications are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions. The
attached proposed ordinance would adopt the statewide codes and amend them to address local conditions.

Staff has reviewed the statewide codes and recommends their adoption with a minimum of technical changes in all
codes, except for several significant changes in the Green Building Standards Code related to electrical vehicle
charging stations and construction and demolition debris recovery, which are further described below. The State
did not adopt the new International Housing Codes, and therefore the 1997 Uniform Housing Code (UHC), with
local amendments, continues as the adopted housing code for the County.

The proposed Ordinance No. 2016-22 amends the statewide codes due to local climatic, geographical, and
topographic conditions. These conditions are described in the attached Findings. The following are the substantive
changes to the 2016 California Building Standards Code:

e Modifications to the 2016 California Building Code:

e More restrictive standards for some building foundations to better withstand seismic forces found in
this region of California. This amendment is the same as the local amendment made to previous
statewide code.

e Requires the installation of hard-wired smoke detectors in existing flat roof buildings when a pitched
roof is added on top of the existing flat roof and the solid sheathing of the flat roof is not removed.
This amendment is the same as the local amendment made to previous statewide code.

e Modifications to the 2016 California Residential Code:

e Prohibits in single family dwellings and accessory structures braced wall panels that use gypsum
wallboard and limits in single family dwellings and accessory structures the use of braced wall
panels that use Portland Cement Plaster to dwellings and accessory structures of only one story, as
these materials have performed poorly during recent California seismic events. This is the only new
amendment, not made to the previous state-wide code.

e Modifications to the 2016 California Green Building Standards Code:
o Electric vehicle charging stations requirements. These amendments are the same as the local
amendments made to the previous statewide code. The substantive amendments are as follows:
o For new multi-family buildings:
o Increase the required number of Electric Vehicle Charging Spaces ("EV spaces") to five
percent of the total number of parking spaces provided, where three percent is the
minimum required in the statewide code.



¢ Require a minimum of one EV space for every new multi-family building (three or more
units) as opposed to statewide code which requires no EV spaces for multi-family
buildings with fewer than 17 units.

o Require that Electric Vehicle Supply Equipment ("EVSE") be installed for each EV
space in addition to the electrical infrastructure required by the statewide code.

o For new non-residential buildings:

¢ Required number of EV spaces in new construction shall provide fully operational EVSE
as opposed to statewide code which requires electrical infrastructure only.

o Increase the required number of EV spaces for projects with more than nine parking
spaces and less than 201 parking spaces.

e More restrictive construction waste reduction, disposal and recycling standards consistent with those
presently enforced in the County. The County currently enforces Chapter 418-14 (Construction and
Demolition Debris Recovery) of Division 418 (Refuse) of the County ordinance. Chapter 418-14 was
written and adopted when the state-wide codes did not have any requirements regarding debris recovery.
The ordinance amends the 2016 California Green Building Standards Code (CGBSC) to incorporate the
more restrictive requirements from Chapter 418-14. Chapter 418-14 will be deleted in its entirety. The
substantive amendments to the 2016 California Green Building Standards are as follows:

e Imposes the mandatory restrictions from Chapter 4 of the 2016 CGBSC on certain additional projects
for existing residential buildings including:
o Projects that increase the total combined conditioned and unconditioned building area by 5,000
square feet or more.
o Projects that impact 5,000 square feet or more of the total combined conditioned and
unconditioned building area.
e Demolition projects when a demolition permit is required, except demolition projects that are
necessary to abate a public nuisance.
o Deletes the exception from construction waste management requirements for projects solely based on
their isolated location from diversion facilities.
¢ Requires that weight and not volume is used to measure the amount of the construction and
demolition debris disposed and diverted.
e Requires that more comprehensive documentation for construction waste management be provided to
the enforcing agency and making submittal of the same a prerequisite for scheduling final inspections.

e Modifications to the 2016 California Existing Building Code:
e The amendments to the 2016 California Existing Building Code are not substantive in nature and are
limited to administrative provisions for the use and enforcement of this Code and to be consistent
with the administrative provisions of the other statewide codes as amended.

CONSEQUENCE OF NEGATIVE ACTION:

If the proposed ordinance is not approved, the County will not be able to adopt the 2016 California Building
Standards Code as amended.

ATTACHMENTS
Ordinance No. 2016-22
Findings




ORDINANCE NO. 2016-22
ADOPTION OF CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS CODES

The Contra Costa County Board of Supervisors ordains as follows (omitting the parenthetical
footnotes from the official text of the enacted or amended provisions of the County Ordinance
Code):

SECTION I. SUMMARY. This ordinance adopts the 2016 California Building Code, the 2016
California Residential Code, the 2016 California Green Building Standards Code, the 2016
California Electrical Code, the 2016 California Plumbing Code, the 2016 California Mechanical
Code, and the 2016 California Existing Building Code, with changes, additions, and deletions
that are necessary because of local climatic, geological, or topographical conditions. This
ordinance is adopted pursuant to Health and Safety Code sections 17922, 17958, 17958.5, and
17958.7, and Government Code sections 50020 through 50022.10.

SECTION II. Section 74-2.002 (Adoption) of Division 74 (Building Code) of the County
Ordinance Code is amended to read:

74-2.002 Adoption.

(a) The building code of this county is the 2016 California Building Code (California Code
of Regulations, Title 24, Part 2, Volumes 1 and 2), the 2016 California Residential Code
(California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 2.5), the 2016 California Green Building
Standards Code (California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 11), and the 2016
California Existing Building Code (California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 10), as
amended by the changes, additions, and deletions set forth in this division and Division
72.

(b) The 2016 California Building Code, with the changes, additions, and deletions set forth in
Chapter 74-4 and Division 72, is adopted by this reference as though fully set forth in this
division.

(c) The 2016 California Residential Code, with the changes, additions, and deletions set forth
in Chapter 74-4 and Division 72, is adopted by this reference as though fully set forth in
this division.

(d) The 2016 California Green Building Standards Code, with the changes, additions, and
deletions set forth in Chapter 74-4 and Division 72, is adopted by this reference as though
fully set forth in this division.

(e) The 2016 California Existing Building Code, with the changes, additions, and deletions

ORDINANCE NO. 2016-22
1



®

(2

set forth in Chapter 74-4 and Division 72, is adopted by this reference as though fully set
forth in this division.

At least one copy of this building code is now on file with the building inspection
division, and the other requirements of Government Code section 50022.6 have been and
shall be complied with.

As of the effective date of the ordinance from which this division is derived, the
provisions of the building code are controlling and enforceable within the county. (Ords.
2016-22 § 2,2013-24 § 2,2011-03 § 2, 2007-54 §3, 2002-31 § 3, 99-17 § 5, 99-1, 90-100
§5,87-55§4,80-14 § 5, 74-30.)

SECTION III. Chapter 74-4 (Modifications) of Division 74 (Building Code) of the County
Ordinance Code is amended to read:

Chapter 74-4
MODIFICATIONS

74-4.002 Amendments to CBC. The 2016 California Building Code ("CBC") is amended by
the changes, additions, and deletions set forth in this chapter and Division 72. Section numbers
used below are those of the 2016 California Building Code.

(a)

CBC Chapter 1 (Scope and Administration) is amended by the provisions of Division 72
of this code and as follows:

(1) Sections 103, 109, 112, 113, 114, and 116 of CBC Chapter 1 are deleted.

(2) In Section 105.2 (Work exempt from permit) of CBC Chapter 1, subsection 4 is
amended to read:

4. Retaining walls that are not more than 3 feet in height measured
from the top of the footing to the top of the wall and that have a
downward ground slope at the bottom of the retaining wall not
exceeding 1(vertical):10(horizontal), unless supporting a surcharge
or ground slope exceeding 1(vertical):2(horizontal) or impounding
Class L, 11, or IlI-a liquids.

3) Section 107.1 (Submittal Documents - General) of CBC Chapter 1 is amended by
deleting the exception.

4) Section 107.2.1 (Information on construction documents) of CBC Chapter 1 is
amended to read:

ORDINANCE NO. 2016-22
2



(b)

(c)

107.2.1 Information on Construction Documents. Construction
documents shall include dimensions and shall be drawn to scale on
suitable material. Electronic media documents may be submitted when
approved in advance by the building official. Construction documents
shall be of sufficient clarity to indicate the location, nature, and extent of
the work proposed and to show in detail that it will conform to this code
and all relevant laws, ordinances, rules, and regulations. The first sheet of
each set of plans shall include contact information for the owner and the
person or persons who prepared the plans. Plans shall include a plot plan
showing all existing property lines labeled and fully dimensioned, the
elevations of the top and toe of cuts and fills, and the location of the
proposed building with distances to all property lines and to every existing
building on the property. Instead of detailed specifications, the county
building official may approve references on the plans to a specific section
or part of this code or other ordinances or laws.

(5) Section 110.1 (Inspections - General) of CBC Chapter 1 is amended by adding the
following to the end of that section:

At the time of first inspection by the county building official, a California
licensed Land Surveyor or Civil Engineer shall certify in writing that the
structure is placed according to the approved set of plans. The written
certification must include the site address and permit number. This
requirement does not apply to alterations or repairs to existing structures
that do not affect the exterior limits of the existing structures.

Section 907.2.11.9 (Existing Group R Occupancies) of CBC Chapter 9 (Fire Protection
Systems) is amended to read:

907.2.11.9 Existing Group R Occupancies. In existing flat roof buildings, the
installation of a smoke detector that complies with California Residential Code
Section R314.6 shall be required when a pitched roof is added on top of the
existing flat roof and the solid sheathing of the flat roof is not removed.

Section 1406.5 is added to Section 1406 (Combustible Materials on the Exterior Side of
Exterior Walls) of CBC Chapter 14 (Exterior Walls), to read:

1406.5 Wood shakes or shingles. Wood shakes or shingles used for exterior
wall covering shall be fire treated unless there is a minimum of 10 feet from the
exterior wall (including shakes or shingles) to the property line of all sides, except
for any sides of exterior walls facing the street.

ORDINANCE NO. 2016-22
3



(d) In Section 1705.3 (Concrete construction) of CBC Chapter 17 (Special Inspections and
Tests), Exception 1 is amended to read:

1. Isolated spread concrete footings of buildings three stories or less above
grade plane that are fully supported on earth or rock, where the structural
design of the footing is based on a specified compressive strength of no
greater than 2,500 pound per square inch (psi) (17.2 Mpa).

(e) Section 1809.8 (Plain concrete footings) of CBC Chapter 18 (Soils and Foundations) is
deleted.

® Section 1810.3.9.3 (Placement of reinforcement) of CBC Chapter 18 (Soils and
Foundations) is amended by deleting Exception 3.

(2) Section 1906 (Structural Plain Concrete) of CBC Chapter 19 (Concrete) is deleted.

(h) Section 1907.1 (Minimum Slab Provisions - General) of CBC Chapter 19 (Concrete) is
amended by adding the following sentence to that section:

Slabs shall have 6-inch by 6-inch by 10-gauge wire mesh or equal at mid-height.

(1) Appendix C and Appendix I of the CBC are incorporated into the County building code.
Appendix A, Appendix B, Appendix D, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G,
Appendix H, Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, and Appendix M of the CBC are
excluded from the County building code. (Ords. 2016-22 § 3, 2013-24 § 3,2011-03 § 3,
2007-54 § 4, 2002-31 § 3, 99- 17 § 6, 99-1, 90-100 § 6, 87-55 § 5, 80-14 § 6, 74-30 § 1.)

74-4.004 Amendments to CRC. The 2016 California Residential Code ("CRC") is amended by
the changes, additions, and deletions set forth in this chapter and Division 72. Section numbers
used below are those of the 2016 California Residential Code.

(a) Sections R103, R108, R111, R112, R113, and R114 of CRC Chapter 1 (Scope and
Application) are deleted.

(b) In Section R105.2 (Work exempt from permit) of CRC Chapter 1 (Scope and
Application), subsection 3 is amended to read:

3. Retaining walls that are not more than 3 feet in height measured from the
top of the footing to the top of the wall and that have a downward ground
slope at the bottom of the retaining wall not exceeding
1 (vertical):10(horizontal), unless supporting a surcharge or ground slope
exceeding 1(vertical):2(horizontal) or impounding Class L, II, or IlI-a

ORDINANCE NO. 2016-22
4



(c)

(d)

(e)

liquids.

Table R602.10.3(3) (Bracing Requirements Based on Seismic Design Category) of CRC
Chapter 6 (Wall Construction) is amended as follows:

(1) The title of Table R602.10.3(3) is amended to read:
TABLE R602.10.3(3)"
(2) Footnote "f" is added to Table R602.10.3(3), to read:

f. In Seismic Design Categories DO, D1, and D2, Method GB is not
permitted and the use of Method PCP is limited to one-story single
family dwellings and accessory structures.

Section R602.10.4.4 is added to Section R602.10.4 (Construction methods for braced
wall panels) of CRC Chapter 6 (Wall Construction), to read:

R602.10.4.4 Limits on methods GB and PCP. In Seismic Design Categories
DO, D1, and D2, Method GB is not permitted for use as intermittent braced wall
panels, but gypsum board is permitted to be installed when required by this
section to be placed on the opposite side of the studs from other types of braced
wall panel sheathing. In Seismic Design Categories DO, D1, and D2, the use of
Method PCP is limited to one-story single family dwellings and accessory
structures.

Appendix H of the CRC is incorporated into the County building code. Appendix A,
Appendix B, Appendix C, Appendix D, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G,
Appendix I, Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M, Appendix N, Appendix
O, Appendix P, Appendix Q, Appendix R, Appendix S, Appendix T, Appendix U,
Appendix V, and Appendix W of the CRC are excluded from the County building code.
(Ords. 2016-22 § 3,2013-24 § 3,2011-03 § 3.)

74-4.006 Amendments to CGBSC. The 2016 California Green Building Standards Code
("CGBSC") is amended by the changes, additions, and deletions set forth in this chapter and
Division 72. Section numbers used below are those of the 2016 California Green Building
Standards Code.

(a)

Section 301.1.1 (Additions and alterations) of CGBSC Chapter 3 (Green Building) is
amended to read:

Section 301.1.1 Additions and alterations. The mandatory provisions of

ORDINANCE NO. 2016-22
5



Chapter 4 shall apply to additions or alterations of existing residential buildings
where the addition or alteration increases the building's conditioned area, volume,
or size. The requirements shall apply only to and/or within the specific area of the
addition or alteration.

The mandatory provisions of Section 4.408 shall apply to the following types of
construction or demolition projects for existing residential buildings:

1. Projects that increase the total combined conditioned and
unconditioned building area by 5,000 square feet or more.

2. Alterations to existing structures impacting 5,000 square feet or
more of total combined conditioned and unconditioned building
area.

3. Demolition projects when a demolition permit is required.

Exception: Demolition projects undertaken because the enforcing agency
has determined that the demolition is necessary to abate a public nuisance
or otherwise protect public health and safety.

For the purposes of determining whether a project meets the 5,000 square-foot
threshold, the enforcing agency may deem all phases of a project and all related
projects taking place on a single or adjoining parcel(s) as a single project.

Note: On and after January 1, 2014, residential buildings undergoing permitted
alterations, additions or improvements shall replace noncompliant plumbing
fixtures with water-conserving plumbing fixtures. Plumbing fixture replacement is
required prior to issuance of final completion, certificate of occupancy or final
permit approval by the local building department. See Civil Code Section 1101.1,
et seq., for the definition of a noncompliant plumbing fixture, types of residential
buildings affected and other important enactment dates.

(b) Section 301.3.2 (Waste diversion) of CGBSC Chapter 3 (Green Building) is amended to
read:

Section 301.3.2 Waste diversion. The requirements of Section 5.408 shall apply
to additions, alterations, and demolition whenever a permit is required for work.

Exception: Demolition projects undertaken because the enforcing agency
has determined that the demolition is necessary to abate a public nuisance
or otherwise protect public health and safety.

ORDINANCE NO. 2016-22
6



(©) Section 4.106.4.2 (New multifamily dwellings) of CGBSC Chapter 4 (Residential
Mandatory Measures) is amended to read:

Section 4.106.4.2 New multifamily dwellings. For any new multifamily
dwelling other than a dwelling type specified in Section 4.106.4.1, at least five
percent of the total number of parking spaces provided for all types of parking
facilities, but in no case no less than one parking space, shall be electric vehicle
charging spaces (EV spaces). Each EV space shall be equipped with fully
operational electric vehicle supply equipment (EVSE). The location of each EV
space shall be identified on construction documents. Calculations to determine the
number of EV spaces shall be rounded up to the nearest whole number.

(d) Section 4.408.1 (Construction waste management) of CGBSC Chapter 4 (Residential
Mandatory Measures) is amended to read:

Section 4.408.1 Construction waste management. Recycle and/or salvage for
reuse a minimum of 65 percent of the nonhazardous construction and demolition
waste in accordance with Section 4.408.2.

Exceptions:
1. Excavated soil and land-clearing debris.
2. The enforcing agency may identify alternate waste reduction

requirements if the agency determines that an owner or contractor
has adequately demonstrated that diversion or recycling facilities
necessary for the owner to comply with this section do not exist or
are not located within a reasonable distance from the jobsite.

(e) Section 4.408.2 (Construction waste management plan) of CGBSC Chapter 4
(Residential Mandatory Measures) is amended to read:

Section 4.408.2 Construction waste management plan. Submit a construction
waste management plan for the project, signed by the owner, in conformance with
Items 1 through 5 prior to issuance of building permit. The construction waste
management plan shall be updated as necessary upon approval by the enforcing
agency and shall be available during construction for examination by the
enforcing agency. The plan must do all of the following:

l. Identify the construction and demolition waste materials to be
diverted from disposal by recycling, reuse on the project, or
salvage for future use or sale.

ORDINANCE NO. 2016-22
7



®

(2

2. Specify if construction and demolition waste materials will be
sorted on-site (source-separated) or bulk mixed (single stream).

3. Identify diversion and disposal facilities where the construction
and demolition waste material will be taken and identify the waste
management companies, if any, that will be utilized to haul the
construction and demolition waste material. A waste management
company utilized to haul construction and demolition waste
material must have all applicable County approvals.

4. Identify construction methods employed to reduce the amount of
construction and demolition waste generated.

5. Specify that the amount of construction and demolition debris shall
be calculated consistent with the enforcing agency’s requirements
for the weighing of debris. The owner shall make reasonable
efforts to ensure that all construction and demolition debris
diverted or disposed are measured and recorded using the most
accurate method of measurement available. To the extent
practicable, all construction and demolition debris shall be weighed
using scales. Scales shall be in compliance with all regulatory
requirements for accuracy and maintenance. For construction and
demolition debris for which weighing is not practical due to small
size or other considerations, a volumetric measurement shall be
used. The owner shall convert volumetric measurements to weight
using the standardized conversion factors approved by the
enforcing agency for this purpose.

Section 4.408.3 (Waste management company) of CGBSC Chapter 4 (Residential
Mandatory Measures) is deleted.

Section 4.408.4 (Waste stream reduction alternative [LR]) of CGBSC Chapter 4
(Residential Mandatory Measures) is amended to read:

Section 4.408.4 Waste stream